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Sent: 06/19/2025 at 07:14 AM

From: Ryan Egeland
To: Jennifer Egeland (First Viewed: 06/19/2025 at 07:33 AM)
Subject: Re: Communication Policy and Comms

OFW records obviously show your assertion below is false.  Debating whether two entirely different 
documents with different expense amounts are identical or not is not productive.

I have decided I will no longer explain the reasons for rejecting expenses that dont exactly meet 
documentation requirements.  Please plan accordingly.  Thanks
                    

Sent: 06/18/2025 at 07:55 AM

From: Jennifer Egeland
To: Ryan Egeland (First Viewed: 06/19/2025 at 06:52 AM)
Subject: Re: Communication Policy and Comms

All you do is accuse me and accuse me and accuse me. The receipts were always in there. The 
exact same receipts. 

Sent: 06/18/2025 at 07:24 AM

From: Ryan Egeland
To: Jennifer Egeland (First Viewed: 06/18/2025 at 07:54 AM)
Subject: Re: Communication Policy and Comms

Again, entirely unjustified threats are not typical forms of communications, nor do they follow 
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Again, entirely unjustified threats are not typical forms of communications, nor do they follow 
policy.  Your original request did not contain receipts, and was inflated by $207.33.  I paid all 
proper expenses and will continue to do so.  I will not reimburse inflated or inaccurate expense 
claims, or those without receipts.  Thanks

Sent: 06/17/2025 at 03:09 PM

From: Jennifer Egeland
To: Ryan Egeland (First Viewed: 06/18/2025 at 07:12 AM)
Subject: Re: Communication Policy and Comms

It's not a threat.I'm not gonna argue with you. I put the receipt in the ofw expense.  you can see 
that it's a medical expense with the girls names on there. 

You are the one that brought ada to her  appointment. I sent you maes stuff. I can't upload it if 
ofw won't allow it. 

You can become their guarantor I don't want to deal with it. I have to deal with everything. And 
then beg you to follow the rules.  Its nonsense semantics. I gave you everything that you need. 
For the hundredth time, I looked into it ofw does not allow me to upload a document that you're 
asking me to, and i've already uploaded the receipts. 

If it's not paid, I'm gonna go through my lawyer. It's gonna be very clear to a judge or anybody 
else that that I gave you everything that you need including uploaded receipts. 

Sent: 06/17/2025 at 03:03 PM

From: Ryan Egeland
To: Jennifer Egeland (First Viewed: 06/17/2025 at 03:04 PM)
Subject: Communication Policy and Comms

You requested I check OFW more frequently.  That will happen when messages respect our 
policy.  I requested receipts via OFW expenses.  I and most anyone would consider the below 
message to include a threat.  Do you feel this exchange respects policy? 

Sent: 06/16/2025 at 10:55 PM

From: Jennifer Egeland
To: Ryan Egeland (First Viewed: 06/17/2025 at 01:00 PM)
Subject: Re: Medical expense

Attached is another receipt. I also sent the summary via email from maes appointment with Dr. 
Lien. 

I sent you everything that you need. I will just go to my lawyer if you keep arguing semantics. 
You have receipts. 
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Sent: 06/16/2025 at 10:43 PM

From: Jennifer Egeland
To: Ryan Egeland (First Viewed: 06/17/2025 at 12:59 PM)
Subject: Re: Medical expense

You can submit it. I don't know how to do it. Submit what I sent you in your email. The 
information I sent you via email has everything on there. 
I don't know what you're asking me. It shows the patient balance on both ada and mae and I paid 
it. 
Mae went to Kelley lein for her ear infection. It was not urgent care. 
I will resubmit with the receipt. I paid the girls's expenses and my own at the same time. So I 
blocked out my expenses on the receipt. But as you can see its the same price. 

Sent: 06/16/2025 at 03:06 PM

From: Ryan Egeland
To: Jennifer Egeland (First Viewed: 06/16/2025 at 10:32 PM)
Subject: Re: Medical expense

Please resubmit in OFW so we have all the records captured.  The expense also needs the 
following: 
1) Receipts showing amounts paid (expense only has invoices). 
2) Explanation of charges/expenses for Kelsey Lien - was this urgent care?  I don't recall the 
reason for the visit, or discussing Mae visiting this specific clinic in Wayzata.

Thanks

Sent: 06/16/2025 at 02:48 PM

From: Jennifer Egeland
To: Ryan Egeland (First Viewed: 06/16/2025 at 02:52 PM)
Subject: Medical expense

For the medical expense i just sent made. I emailed you account information.I couldn't get it into 
ofw. 


