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11/3/2024

Sent: 11/03/2024 at 03:14 PM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: School pics Sure. 
Send receipt and bill via OFW and I'll pay it. 
Please send all the original high quality files by 
email or Google Photos. Tx

Sent: 11/03/2024 at 03:07 PM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Basketball I have one. I don't 
want it to be going back-and-forth. It'll be too annoying to 
get it back from you.

Refusal/Excuse: Claiming adherence to the proper 
method (sending the bill via OFW) would be "too 
annoying."

11/15/2024

Sent: 11/15/2023 at 10:21 AM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Vaccines I saw 
your expense submission for reimbursement. The 
charges of $347 are not joint for the reasons I 
explained in OFW prior. If you resubmit for the 
appropriate price of $35 each (plus tax/fees), I'll 
accept.

(No direct response addressing the request to resubmit the 
expense at the correct price was immediately found in the 
sources. Subsequent messages from Jennifer changed the 
subject to Thanksgiving or new expenses.)

Non-Response/Ignored Instruction: Did not 
acknowledge or agree to resubmit the corrected 
expense request.

2/21/2024

Sent: 02/21/2024 at 03:07 PM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Medical Records 
and Pediatrician Details I find only a minute clinic 
receipt in my email. Please send me anything you 
sent by OFW (not email), as we are obligated to 
do. I am simply asking for the pediatrician's name, 
as well as the office visit notes to confirm Ada's 
evaluation and diagnosis. I originally asked for this 
simple information on Feb 4, but have not yet 
received a response.

Sent: 02/21/2024 at 07:55 AM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Medical Records and 
Pediatrician Details Sent in email. Like I said. Figure out 
who the providers are.

Deflection/Refusal: Refusing to provide 
documentation via the mandated channel (OFW) 
and insisting Ryan locate the information himself.

2/3/2025

Sent: 02/03/2025 at 10:15 PM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Expenses Please 
submit the receipt for the actual visit charges 
with that information.

Sent: 02/04/2025 at 11:25 AM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Expenses This is all i could find. 
It's clearly the bill. It would be nice if you don't try to 
exhaust me with semantics. It would be great if like one 
thing could be done without a back and forth argument 
from you. If you don't pay it. i'm not gonna argue with you. 
You can always call allina, you know, ada's information. But 
I will have to take it to my lawyer. I'm just letting you 
know, but I will not be going back and forth anymore.

Deflection/Threat: Accusing Ryan of using 
"semantics" to "exhaust" her, refusing further 
discussion, and threatening to involve her lawyer.

6/16/2025

Sent: 06/16/2025 at 03:06 PM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Medical expense 
Please resubmit in OFW so we have all the 
records captured. The expense also needs the 
following: 1) Receipts showing amounts paid 
(expense only has invoices). 2) Explanation of 
charges/expenses for Kelsey Lien - was this urgent 
care? I don't recall the reason for the visit, or 
discussing Mae visiting this specific clinic in 
Wayzata.

Sent: 06/16/2025 at 10:55 PM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Medical expense Attached is 
another receipt. I also sent the summary via email from 
maes appointment with Dr. Lien. I sent you everything that 
you need. I will just go to my lawyer if you keep arguing 
semantics. You have receipts.

Threat/Deflection: Claiming she sent "everything," 
calling Ryan's request "arguing semantics," and 
immediately threatening legal action.

6/17/2025

Sent: 06/17/2025 at 03:03 PM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Communication 
Policy and Comms You requested I check OFW 
more frequently. That will happen when messages 
respect our policy. I requested receipts via OFW 
expenses. I and most anyone would consider the 
below message to include a threat. Do you feel this 
exchange respects policy?

Sent: 06/17/2025 at 03:04 PM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Communication Policy and 
Comms It's not a threat. I'm not gonna argue with you. I 
put the receipt in the ofw expense. you can see that it's a 
medical expense with the girls names on there.

Deflection/Denial: Denying that her previous 
explicit threat was a threat, thus evading 
accountability regarding communication policy 
adherence.

6/18/2025

Sent: 06/18/2025 at 07:24 AM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Communication 
Policy and Comms Again, entirely unjustified 
threats are not typical forms of communications, 
nor do they follow policy. Your original request did 
not contain receipts, and was inflated by $207.33. I 
paid all proper expenses and will continue to do so. 
I will not reimburse inflated or inaccurate 
expense claims, or those without receipts. Thanks

Sent: 06/19/2025 at 07:10 AM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Medical expense Ryan...you 
aren't following custody terms. The parent who has the kid 
makes the medical decision. You were informed. Its 
expensive because the insurance isnt great.

Deflection/Accusation: Ignoring the documentation 
and inflation claims entirely, shifting the argument 
to accuse Ryan of violating custody terms regarding 
medical decisions.

These documented communication struggles illustrate the difficulties Ryan faced when attempting to enforce financial compliance and policy adherence. 
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6/19/2025

Sent: 06/19/2025 at 07:47 AM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Ymca When 
expenses submitted have legitimate receipts that 
equal the amount requested I will will approve 
them. This one does not. As I mentioned, I am not 
able to engage in text exchanges about this or 
future missing expenses documentation again. 
Thanks

Sent: 06/19/2025 at 07:40 AM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Communication Policy and 
Comms Ryan you cant not tell me why you aren't paying for 
something. If you want to make this another thing...fine. I 
will just go my lawyer. Or jennifer. Costing you more. Im 
not going to beg you. It is quite possible that you and I have 
a different perspective of things. You cant just say im wrong 
because I don't do something the way you like or want.

Threat/Emotional Appeal: Responding to the 
rejection of the receipt by focusing on the argument 
itself, issuing another threat, and declaring she 
won't "beg."

8/26/2025

Sent: 08/26/2025 at 10:30 AM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Expense 
Submissions 1. For Mae's medical expenses, you 
are required to submit a payment of receipt. You 
submitted an insurance estimate of charges. 2. 
You have submitted many expenses for trivial 
charges for kids supplies, sports equipment, etc. 
Please send me the language in the court order 
which directs us to submit those, as I couldn't 
find it. 3. Given the documented history of 
inaccurate expenses including inflated charges, I 
may reject expenses without proper receipts in the 
future. To avoid this and any potential conflict, I 
suggest submitting complete receipts as a PDF, 
and not partial screenshots.

Sent: 08/26/2025 at 11:10 AM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Expense Submissions Please 
stop trying to argue with me on everything. This is so 
dumb. I will give you whatever you need.Ryan. just ask.

Emotional Deflection/Feigned Confusion: 
Characterizing the detailed instructions as a 
"dumb" argument and denying that she understood 
what was needed, despite Ryan's clear, multi-point 
list.

8/29/2025

Sent: 08/29/2025 at 08:57 AM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Expense 
Submissions Why have you not responded to this 
question? I don't recall anything in the order. 
(Referring to the lack of legal basis for submitting 
expenses for "trivial charges".)

Sent: 08/29/2025 at 08:59 AM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Expense Submissions There 
shouldn't have to be in order for you to pay half of the school 
supplies. And paying for activities includes sports gear. You 
didn't answer my question. Do you feel that it's only my 
responsibility to get the girls' school supplies? You just 
assume i'm going to do it, and then you don't split it with 
me.That's all i'm asking. I'm not gonna argue with you if 
you're going to be petty about this. It's sad to me that you 
need orders to be reasonable.

Deflection/Accusation: Avoiding the legal question 
about the court order by attacking Ryan's character, 
calling him "petty," and demanding he answer her 
rhetorical question about his intentions.

9/1/2025

Sent: 09/01/2025 at 09:48 AM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Expense 
Submissions Please cancel all requests for 
expenses not part of the court order. As I said, I 
will not renegotiate or discuss terms of your 
financial support on ofw.

Sent: 09/01/2025 at 09:50 AM From: Jennifer Egeland To: 
Ryan Egeland Subject: Re: Expense Submissions Tell me 
what part is not part of the court order? Certainly, the 
soccer gear is part of activities? Are you...

Evasion: Refusing to comply with the cancellation 
request and demanding Ryan enumerate which 
items violate the court order, placing the burden 
back on him.

9/12/2025

Sent: 09/12/2025 at 06:28 AM From: Ryan Egeland 
To: Jennifer Egeland Subject: Re: Tomorrow we'll 
child I am taking the non-response below as 
confirmation of the factual record within OFW as 
described. Your actions ignored the intent and 
obligations of joint custody. The choice of clinics 
and providers, scheduling of appointments, and 
visits all happened without any record in OFW of a 
single good faith effort to involve or even inform me. 
When routine, non-emergency medical decisions 
and visits don't appripriately involve or include 
me, I will not reimburse the associated expenses. 
Thanks

(No response from Jennifer to this message is recorded in 
the sources.)

Non-Response: Did not address the final policy 
declaration that non-compliant medical expenses 
would be rejected.


